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Preface 

This volume contains papers in final form from the American Mathemat-
ical Society special session on combinatorial group theory-infinite groups 
held at the University of Maryland April 1988. This session was organized 
by A. Gaglione of the Naval Academy, C. Y. Tang of the University of Water-
loo, and B. Fine of Fairfield University. This special session was designed to 
bring together researchers in various areas of infinite group theory, especially 
combinatorial group theory, to share methods and results. 

We were impressed with the vitality and interest in infinite group theory as 
reflected in this conference. There were eighteen speakers at the session, and 
the talks covered a wide range of group theory from purely logical questions 
to geometric methods. For many reasons-a large number originating in 
topological and geometric results-there is heightened interest in classical 
combinatorial group theory and its questions. This was reflected by the sheer 
volume of work presented at the conference. 

The papers in this volume represent a mix of pure research papers and 
expository papers. In keeping with what we feel is the spirit of the Contem-
porary Mathematics series we hope that the majority of the papers are clear 
enough to the nonspecialist to convey a sense of the direction of the field. 
Some of the papers of course contain entirely new results and the editors wish 
to thank the participants for using this volume as an outlet for their work. 

While no single volume can present the total state of affairs in modern 
combinatorial group theory we hope that this work will serve as an entry 
point for people interested in learning where the discipline is. 

We wish to thank the referees for their dedicated work in evaluating the 
papers. We would also like to thank Connie Engle, Pat Struse , and Diane 
Berezowski for their fine typing job. 

The participants at the conference were Seymour Bachmuth, Gilbert Baum-
slag, Katalin Bencsath, Ben Fine, Thomas Fournelle, Anthony Gaglione, John 
Labute, Luise Kappe, Kathryn Kuiken, Jerry Levine, Alex Lichtman, Murray 
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Macbeath, Ian Macdonald, Jim McCool, John Ratcliffe, Luis Ribes, Derek 
Robinson, Gerhard Rosenberger, Dennis Spellman, Francis Tang, Marvin 
Tretkoff, Herman Waldinger, and Ken Weston. 

Ben Fine 
Anthony Gaglione 

Francis Tang 
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